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ABSTRACT 
 
Traditionally, tourism was placed second as a priority in the agenda of 

investors, policy makers, and academics. Previous studies have attempted to explain 
destination and/or firm strategic positions by focusing on (mostly demand side factors) 
prices, exchange rates, qualitative and other institutional factors. Supply side factors 
and in particular company strategy contact and performance have not been taking 
explicitly into consideration. However, important pioneer research has been done 
regarding the globalization of the service sector and the hotel industry.  To continue 
this important stream of research this paper examines the significance of MNEs in the 
Hotels sector in France, Greece, Italy, Portugal and Spain. 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
INTRODUCTION 
 
Traditionally, tourism was placed second as a priority in the agenda of 

investors, policy makers, and academics.  Tourism is not an industry in the “classical 
sense” and the tourism product is complex and of a perishable nature (Archer, 1987). 
The tourism product is consumed at the place (destination country) and the time it is 
produced and it is based on social interaction between the supplier and the consumer, 
where its quality is mainly defined by this interaction.  Tourism consumption spreads 
into many markets and links a series of cross-cutting activities involving the provision 
of goods and services such as accommodation, transport, entertainment, construction, 
and agricultural and fisheries production (UNCTAD, 2007). Therefore its structure 
encompasses a wide diversity of players, ranging from global MNEs to Small and 
Medium-Sized Enterprises (SMEs).  

 
The tourism industry has benefited from the process of globalization (Manera 

and Taberner, 2006). Tourism is today one of the most internationalized sectors of the 
world economy. The world tourism market has been substantially extended, adding 
considerably to the potential for further growth and at the same time bringing about 
greater competition between tourism countries. (OECD, 2005).  

 
According to World Tourism Organization (WTO), the European Union (EU) 

numbered six Member States among the top 10 countries in the world welcoming the 
largest number of international tourist arrivals. Within the EU, receipts from 
international tourism in 2004 were highest in Spain, France, and Italy, followed by 
Greece and Portugal (mainly Mediterranean destinations). Mediterranean is considered 
to be the most popular destination worldwide (Briguglio & Vella, 1995). The most 
important feature of the Mediterranean tourism is the diffused sea – side installation. 
The tourist resources of the Mediterranean countries succeeded in attracting the 
international tourism. These elements give originality and iniquity to the territory of 
the Mediterranean area. (Amico and Giudice, 2006) It is one of the regions that offer a 
wide variety to its tourists. From traditional sun and sand destinations (like Spain, 
Turkey and Tunisia) to those with a high cultural or heritage-based component (in 
particular France and Italy), the Mediterranean’s coastal areas are mainly visited for 
holiday and leisure purposes, although other incentives are gradually gaining ground, 
as is also occurring at a world level, such as travel for health purposes or professional 
and business reasons (Manera and Taberner, 2006). 

 
The hotel and restaurant sector – which mainly covers hotels, restaurants, cafés 

and bars, camping grounds, canteens and catering – has witnessed tremendous 
development in these countries (Eurostat, 2004). In particular Spain, Greece and Italy 
experienced the highest specialization compared with the EU average.  France 
experienced specialization equal to the EU average and Portugal below average 
(Anastassopoulos and Patsouratis, 2004). Previous studies have attempted to explain 
destination and/or firm strategic positions by focusing on (mostly demand side factors) 
prices, exchange rates, qualitative and other institutional factors. Supply side factors 



and in particular company strategy contact and performance have not been taking 
explicitly into consideration. However, important pioneer research has been done 
regarding the globalization of the service sector and the hotel industry (Dunning and 
McQueen 1981, 1982; Boddewyn et al., 1986; Li and Guisinger, 1992; Dunning and 
Kundu, 1995; Constractor and Kundu, 1998). To continue this important stream of 
research this paper examines the significance of MNEs in the Hotels Sector in France, 
Italy, Spain, Greece and Portugal.  The rest of the study is organised as follows: a 
thorough literature review on the investigation of tourism destinations’ 
competitiveness, a discussion of the five South Mediterranean European countries, the 
data and sample, some preliminary empirical results and future research avenues. 

 
LITERATURE REVIEW 

 
The hotel industry is often perceived as one of the most ‘global’ in the service 

sector (Mace, 1995; Litteljohn, 1997). Our investigation is related to the multinational 
subsidiaries’ performance and the competitiveness of locations.  Earlier studies have 
attempted to identify the main aspects of internationalisation in the tourism sector 
(Dunning and Kundu, 1995;Dunning and McQueen, 1982;Johnson and Vanetti, 2005).  
Other studies have also investigated expansion strategies of international hotel firms 
(Chen and Dimou, 2005).  Also, there are studies that investigated the various motives 
for foreign investment in tourism (Dwyer, Forsyth, 1994). Finally, there are studies 
that have attempted to explore multinationals’ entry modes or multinationals’ 
emergence from different countries (Melian-Gonzalez and Garcia-Falcon, 2003; 
Rodriguez, 2002; Williams and Balaz, 2002; Zhao and Olsen, 1997).  This literature is 
of crucial importance to managers and policy makers as both have to address a 
dynamically changing industry.  

 
Many researchers have worked on tourism competitiveness and there are 

several definitions of tourism competitiveness. Scott & Lodge (1985) defined 
competitiveness as the ability of one country to create, produce, distribute and/or 
service products in a global market and economy and be able to make a profit. Spence 
& Hazard (1988) defined competitiveness as a complex concept due to a whole range 
of factors affecting it. It is, thus, both a relative and a multidimensional concept. 
Destination competitiveness is defined as the ability of a destination to offer goods and 
services that are superior to those offered by other destinations (Chens, Sok, K. Sok, 
2008).  Dwyer et al. (2000) stated that tourism competitiveness is a general concept 
that combines price differentials together with exchange rate movement, issues 
influencing and affecting the attractiveness of a destination and the productivity levels 
of different constituents of the tourist industry. From his perspective, therefore, 
competitiveness of a destination is defined as the ability of that destination to sustain 
its market position and share and/or to improve it through time (d’Hartserre, 2000), 
while competitive advantage of a destination refers to a destination’s ability to use 
these resources effectively.  

 
The success of tourist destination can be appreciated by the measurement of 

tourism competitiveness (Crouch & Ritchie, 1994, 1999; Dwyer et al., 2000; Go & 



Govers, 2000; Kozak & Rimmington, 1998, 1999; Mihalic, 2000; Ritchie & Crouch, 
1993, 1995 ; De Keyser & Vanhove, 1994; Evans & Johnson, 1995; Hassan, 2000; 
Kozak, 2001; Sirše & Mihalič, 1999; Thomas & Long, 2000). Dwyer, Forsyth and Rao 
(2000a) state that tourism competitiveness is a general concept that encompasses price 
differentials coupled with exchange rate movements, productivity levels of various 
components of the tourist industry and qualitative factors affecting the attractiveness or 
otherwise of a destination’ (Dwyer et al., 2000). 

 
There are several models focusing on tourism competitiveness. Firstly, the 

studies of Haahti & Yavas (1983) and Kozak & Rimmington (1998, 1999) used survey 
data of perceptions and opinions of visitors such as friendliness of local citizens, 
shopping facilities, and so on to measure the competitiveness of one destination. Poon 
(1993) suggested four main principles: strongly sustaining environment; making 
tourism a leading sector; strengthening the distribution channels in the market; and 
building a dynamic private sector for the destinations to be competitive. De Keyser and 
Vanhove model (1994) argue that the analysis of a competitive position should take 
five groups of competitiveness factors into account: tourism policy, macro economic, 
supply, transport and demand factors. The model has been applied to the Caribbean 
area (De Keyser & Vanhove, 1994) and used in a competitiveness study of Slovenian 
tourism in 1998 (Sirše & Mihalič, 1999). Pearce (1997) pointed out destination 
evaluation techniques and methods that can systematically analyse and compare the 
diverse attributes of competing destinations within a planning concept. Go & Govers 
(1999) used seven attributes, namely facilities, accessibility, quality of service, overall 
affordability, location image, climate and environment and attractiveness to measure 
the destination’s competitive position compared with others. Dwyer et al. (2000) used 
published data to measure the competitiveness of tourist destinations.  

 
In a cohesive empirical approach, Kozak and Rimmington (1999) evaluated the 

quantitative and qualitative aspects of destination competitiveness. According to their 
study, tourists make comparisons between quantitative and qualitative aspects of 
various destinations and make a choice between them. In their study they made a 
comparison between Mediterranean destinations and found that the friendliness of 
local people, value for money, safety and security, local transport, natural environment 
and food are some of the factors which were ranked as the most positive elements of 
the tourism industry in Turkey for example. 

 
Other studies, like the one by Mihalic (2000), suggest that the environmental 

quality refers to the quality of the natural features of the destination that can, 
eventually, be deteriorated by human activities. Hassan (2000) went a step further and 
measured the market competitiveness by using four determinants: comparative 
advantage includes factors concerned with macro- and micro-environments that are 
important to market competitiveness); demand orientation (the ability of a destination 
to counter the change of market demand); industry structure; and environmental 
commitment.  
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One crucial point in all studies refers to the actual measurement of 
competitiveness.  According to Dwyer et al. (2003), there is no single or unique unit of 
indicators that can exploit and apply to all destinations at all times. Generally, there are 
two kinds of variables used, objectively measured variables such as visitor numbers 
and market share, and subjectively measured variables such as image, climate, and so 
on. (C. Y. Chens, P. Sok, K. Sok, 2008)  To this extent, Dwyer, Forsyth and Rao 
(2000) constructed indices of price competitiveness taking into account of both travel 
costs to and from 19 competing destinations whilst Ritchie and Crouch (2000) made an 
effort to create a model that measures destination competitiveness by combining the 
elements of tourism and industry competitiveness. They stated that a destination's 
competitiveness is a country's ability to create added value and thus increase the 
national wealth by managing assets and processes, attractiveness, aggressiveness and 
proximity, and there by integrating these relationships within an economic and social 
model that takes into account a destination's natural capital and its preservation for 
future generations. In their study they argue that competitiveness is deceptive without 
sustainability and that to be competitive the development of tourism in any destination 
must be sustainable. It cannot just be economically or ecologically sustainable, but it 
must be socially, culturally and politically sustainable as well. Following that, in 2003, 
they presented the Conceptual Model of Destination Competitiveness. It has five key 
determinants, namely destination policy, planning and development, destination 
management, core resources and attractors, and supporting factors and resources. 
(Ritchie & Crouch, 2003). 

 
Based on this model, Dwyer, Livaic, and Mellor (2003) created the Integrated 

model that included some variables identified by Ritchie and Crouch In their model 
they included factors such as Inherited Resources, Created Resources, Supporting 
Factors and Resources, Destination Management, Situational Conditions and Demand 
Conditions. (Dwyer, Livaic, & Mellor, 2003). The model has been empirically tested 
on the cases of Korea and Australia, in 2001, and in 2004 its methodology was applied 
to evaluate the tourism competitiveness of Slovenia.  

 
From an empirical perspective, Dwyer & Kim (2003) used 131 indicators 

categorised into seven main sections, namely: endowed resource, created resources, 
supporting factors, destination management, situational conditions, demand factors and 
market performance indicators.  Omerzel (2006) proposes a model using 85 indicators 
to measure tourism competitiveness classified under six main headings: inherited 
resources, created resources, supporting factors and resources, destination 
management, situational conditions and demand conditions. WTTC (2006) uses 23 
indicators under eight main headings, namely: human tourism indicator, price 
indicator, infrastructure indicator, environment indicator, technology indicator, human 
resource indicator, openness indicator and social indicators, to measure the 
competitiveness of countries all around the world.  Although the majority of the 
studies, discussed above, capture a tourist destination’s competitiveness, the emphasis 
put on the characteristics of firms, domestic and multinationals, is almost non-existent.  
To this end, this is the main contribution of this paper.  It bridges the two streams of 
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the literature by adopting a corporate perspective and more specifically focusing on the 
behaviour of multinationals in the South Mediterranean European countries. 

 
THE FIVE SOUTH MEDITERRANEAN EUROPEAN COUNTRIES 
 
Mediterranean is considered to be the most popular destination worldwide 

(Briguglio & Vella, 1995). The most important feature of the Mediterranean tourism is 
the diffused seaside.  These key elements give originality to the territory of the 
Mediterranean area and make it an incomparable destination. (Amico; Giudice, 2006).  
Tourism activities, in the area, range from traditional sun and sand destinations, like 
Spain, to those with a high cultural or heritage-based component, in particular France, 
Greece and Italy. Although the Mediterranean’s coastal areas are mainly visited for 
holiday and leisure purposes, alternative tourism activities are gradually gaining 
ground, such as travel for health purposes or professional and business reasons ( 
Manera; Taberner, 2006). 

 
Within the global tourism industry, the Mediterranean countries represent the 

most important place visited by tourists with 237.5 millions of foreign arrivals which 
represents 34.4% of the world’s total (Manera; Taberner, 2006).  Projections for the 
area show that in 2010 the arrivals in the Mediterranean countries will increase by at 
least 2.8%. In particular the Southern Mediterranean Europe performed quite well last 
year when one takes into consideration that the only global events that took place in 
the region were the Rugby World Cup in France and the Americas Cup in Valencia, 
Spain. On the other hand factors such as the weakening of US dollar, the increase in 
interest rates, the climate change, the increase of the oil price didn’t seem to affect the 
performance of Southern Mediterranean Europe that was for year 2006 the “star 
performer” according to UNWTO. 

 
It is therefore evident that Southern Mediterranean Europe is one of the most 

important sub-regions in the world and in Europe, in particular, regarding international 
tourist arrivals. It holds nearly 20 per cent of world share and more than a third of the 
overall regional volume. In 2004, destinations in Southern Mediterranean Europe 
received over 149 million arrivals, which represent a 2% growth over the 2003 figures. 
Among the mature destinations in the Euro-zone, Spain continues to perform rather 
positively (+3%), while arrivals declined acutely in Italy (-6%) and somewhat 
stagnated in Portugal (-0.8%) (WTO, 2005).  Within this context the rest of this section 
will provide a description on the situation in the five countries of the Southern 
Mediterranean Europe under examination. 

 
Following the success of the World Cup in France during 1998, the French 

Government Tourist Office strived to maintain growth rates in all regions. Partnerships 
with Air France and Brittany Ferries set out to promote different aspects of French 
holidays from skiing, golf and special interest travel as well as the more traditional sun 
and sand holidays in coastal regions.  This led to a transformation of the French 
tourism product.  Indicative figures of this transformation are recent the tourism flows 
which place France in the 10th place globally with 79 million tourism arrivals in 2006, 



90% of which came from European countries. The international tourism receipts were 
42,910 mil US $ in 2006 (UNWTO, 2008).  In the French case the tourism industry 
generates annual revenues of approximately 11% of the GDP.  It is therefore obvious 
why France takes tourism really serious (WTTC, 2008). 

 
Greece is usually selected by international tourists solely as a place of 

recreation, whereas cultural and other qualitative elements are not the main incentives 
of tourist attractiveness (Patsouratis, Fragouli, and Anastassopoulos, 2005). This 
perception has resulted in a highly seasonal industry, focused primarily on the Islands, 
and largely dependent on low return package tours for its success (WTTC, 2005). 
Greece, like France with the World Cup, seems to have benefited from the Olympic 
Game effect, especially from long-haul markets – the USA, for example, rose by some 
30% in terms of arrivals. While unfortunate events like the forest fires in August 2007 
received much media attention, they appear to have had little effect on tourism 
demand, although this cannot yet be substantiated by official statistics. Currently, the 
Greek tourism industry is transforming its competitive positioning from a low cost 
recreational only location, to a location offering higher quality and value for money as 
well as specialised tourism activities, i.e. agro-tourism, winter sports, conference 
tourism and archaeologically related tourism.  In addition to focusing on more affluent 
travellers, Greece is also trying to promote itself as a year round destination, rather 
than just a summer only destination. Given that tourism generates annual revenues of 
around 15% of GDP, these efforts are being taken very seriously. 

 
 Italy is another developed Southern Mediterranean European country with an 

important tourism sector. Although in the Italian case we do not observe the same 
transformational process as in the previous two cases, i.e. France and Greece, Italy has 
the last couple of years focused on high class tourists that can generate substantial 
revenues for local tourism and hospitality companies.  Indicative of this are the recent 
tourism flows with Italy ranking 28th globally with 41 million tourism arrivals in 2006, 
of which 88% came from European countries. The international tourism receipts was 
41,058 million $ in 2006 (UNWTO, 2008) and tourism generates annual revenues of 
around 10% of GDP (WTTC, 2008). 

 
Portugal is another interesting example of a successful exploration of a big 

athletic event to further boost the tourism prospects of the country.  A key policy 
followed targets the equal development of the country as a tourism destination.  The 
Portuguese tourism authorities are monitoring tourism in the south of the country and 
disperse the economic benefits to other parts of the country. The north of the country is 
therefore, currently, subject to a major promotional campaign. It is noted that the north 
of Portugal is the location for many manor houses and cultural attractions, plus the fact 
that it is an important wine growing region. Golfing holidays are also linked to the 
north with new courses opening up. The Lisbon Expo ’98, also, was a major force for 
tourism with a great deal of infrastructure built specifically for the event: the south of 
the country has therefore experienced massive promotion in the recent past. The 
promotion of the north is seen as a way of readressing this balance.  Indicative of this 
transformation are recent tourism flows with Portugal ranking 15th globally with 79 



million tourism arrivals in 2006, 93% of which came from European countries. The 
international tourism receipts were 11,282 million US$ in 2006 (UNWTO, 2008) and 
that tourism generates annual revenues of approximately 15% of GDP (WTTC, 2008). 

 
  Last but not least, Spain has well established itself as one of the most popular 

tourist destinations in the world, thanks to its Mediterranean location and features 
(Rodriguez, 2002). Tourism has played a leading role in the Spanish economy over the 
last 30 years. Apart from its well known contribution to the balance of payment, there 
are no doubts about tourism’s key role in the generation of incomes and jobs. (E.F. 
Sola, 1992). Tourism represent 9 % of Spain’s gross domestic product, offering 
employment to 1.3 million people (Secretaria General de Turismo, Libro Blanco de1 
Turismo, Espaniol, Madrid. Secretaria General de Turismo, 1990).  Amongst the five 
countries under investigation, Spain is the most widely referenced success case 
regarding the expansion of tourism and the development of economic performance 
(Jimenez; Pulina, 2006).  Currently, Spain is ranked 5th globally with 58 million 
tourism arrivals in 2006, 94% of which came from European countries. The 
international tourism receipts was 51,115 million US $ in 2006 (UNWTO, 2008) and 
in Spain, tourism generates annual revenues of around 18% of GDP (WTTC, 2008). 

 
DATA AND SAMPLE DESCRIPTION 
 
In this paper we combined two different databases to obtain consistent data on 

the tourism industry activities in South European Countries.  Our corporate level data 
come from AMADEUS.  This database covers a large number of European firms and 
is constructed by Bureau Van Dijk in collaboration with 30 large European 
Information Providers.  It contains normalised, with respect to currency and accounting 
standards and thus comparable information on almost 1.5 million European 
corporations.  AMADEUS uses key Information Providers in different markets and the 
primary source of information is the published annual reports of companies. On the 
industry level data where collected from Euromonitor International.  The database 
builds on published and unpublished data from the World Tourism Organisation.  Our 
sample covers five South European countries, i.e. France, Greece, Italy, Portugal and 
Spain for a decade, i.e. the period 1997-2006.  For presentation reasons our basic 
statistics will represent the sample in the most recent period, i.e. 2006 as this is more 
relevant for managerial implications.  Our dataset covers 737 companies participating 
in NACE Revision 1.1 -  55 Sector, which are either domestic ones or subsidiaries of 
MNEs. 

 
EMPIRICAL RESULTS 
 
In Table 1 we present some basic statistics on the tourism industry size for each 

country as well as our sample representation in terms of number of companies.  Italy 
has by far the largest size both in terms of bed-places as well as rooms in tourism 
accommodation.  France and Spain follow, whilst Greece and Portugal are 
significantly lower markets.  The picture is slightly different when it comes to absolute 
number of firms.  Spain and France still have the highest numbers but Italy falls at the 



last place.  The most interesting observation though comes from the number of foreign 
subsidiaries.  Greece attracts a substantial number of MNEs as almost two out of every 
three companies have some kind of international participation in their ownership 
structure.  A correlation coefficient though does not reveal any substantial relationship 
between the size of the market and the number of MNEs present. 

 
Table 1 

Size of Tourism Market and number of Domestic and Multinational Companies 

 

Bed-places in 
tourist 
accommodati
on - '000 

Rooms in 
tourist 
accommod
ation - '000 

Total 
Companies 

Domestic 
Compani
es 

Subsidiaries 
of MNEs 

FRANCE 1232.6 616.3 210 167 43 
ITALY 2056.2 1029.7 61 34 27 
GREECE 695.9 365.9 92 32 60 
SPAIN 1597.5 806.6 304 251 53 
PORTUGAL 261.8 115 70 58 12 
Correlation 
with number 
of MNEs 
subsidiaries 0.213 

0.18
3    

Source: AMADEUS and Euromonitor International 
 
Table 2 presents the international exposure of each market and the relative 

number of MNEs’ subsidiaries.  Data on the International versus Domestic nights are 
presented.  We calculate an international exposure measure, i.e. International over 
Domestic Tourism Nights.  According to this Greece has by far the most 
internationally exposed market with the number of International nights spent being 
almost three times the number of Domestic nights.   This provides a reasonable 
explanation on the large number of MNEs’ subsidiaries present in the Greek market.  
In contrast, Portugal although it has a substantial number of International nights over 
Domestic ones has by far the lowest number of foreign subsidiaries.  A correlation 
coefficient though does not reveal any substantial relationship between the calculated 
ratio and the number of MNEs’ subsidiaries in the economy. 

 
Table 2 

International Exposure of Markets 

 
International 
Tourist Nights 

Domestic 
Tourist 
Nights Ratio (I/D) 

Subsidiaries 
of MNEs 

FRANCE 72532.6 121640.6 0.596286108 43 
ITALY 140810.1 108209.1 1.301277804 27 
GREECE 40800 13990.4 2.916285453 60 
SPAIN 103503.4 138355 0.748100177 53 
PORTUGAL 23757.5 11487.5 2.068117519 12 
Correlation   0.0349  



with number of 
MNEs 
subsidiaries 

Source: AMADEUS and Euromonitor International 
 
A key question in the international business literature is related to the 

improvement in efficiency and productivity that MNEs can generate.  In table 3 we 
present data on the Hotel bed occupancy rates and the number of MNEs’ subsidiaries.  
Greece and France have the highest percentage whilst Portugal underperforms 
substantially showing only a 37% in terms of bed occupancy.  A key point that should 
be made here is relative to the product’s nature.  The tourism product is not something 
that can be stocked or produced immediately once the demand is present.  It requires 
substantial investments and thus a consistent low bed occupancy rate can create 
substantial problems in the long term.  A correlation coefficient reveals a strong 
positive relationship between the bed occupancy rate and the number of MNEs’ 
subsidiaries in the economy.  This finding creates enough scope for further 
investigation. 

 
Table 3 

Market Efficiency and number of MNEs 

Country 
Hotel bed occupancy rates - % of beds 
occupied 

Subsidiaries of 
MNEs 

FRANCE 59.1 43 
ITALY 40.5 27 
GREECE 58.4 60 
SPAIN 54.9 53 
PORTUGAL 37.1 12 
Correlation with 
number of MNEs 
subsidiaries 0.827  

Source: AMADEUS and Euromonitor International 
 
In table 4 we present two measures of size, i.e. Total Assets and number of 

employees, a measure of corporate performance, i.e. Profit (Losses) before taxes and 
finally a measure of the funding, i.e. the long term debt.  In terms of Total Assets the 
Italian and the Spanish companies are substantially larger than the rest.  An interesting 
point is that in Italy, Spain and France the subsidiaries of MNEs are of a similar size to 
domestic companies.  In contrast both for Portugal and Greece Domestic companies 
are significantly larger than subsidiaries of MNEs.  The picture changes though when 
one compares companies based on the number of employees.  Italian, Portuguese and 
Spanish subsidiaries of MNEs are larger than their domestic counterparts.  In Greece 
the differences are rather small whilst France is the only country where domestic 
companies are by far larger than the foreign affiliates.  Spanish companies are the most 
profitable ones in absolute numbers whilst Greek companies, both domestic and 
foreign show losses.  In the Greek case the losses of foreign affiliates are almost five 
times larger on average than those of their domestic competitors.  Finally, Spanish and 



Greek companies rely substantially on long term debt whilst in the Greek, Italian and 
Portuguese case, local companies on average borrow much more than the subsidiaries 
of MNEs. 

 
Table 4 

 Comparative measures of domestic and MNEs’ subsidiaries 

  
Subsidiaries of 
MNEs 

Domestic 
Companies 

Total 
Companies 

Total  FRANCE 51322 56334 55337 
Assets  GREECE 35689 50854 40964 
(000 Euros) ITALY 90803 91082 90960 

  PORTUGAL 33959 49052 46646 
  SPAIN 70245 75955 74953 

Number  FRANCE 389 847 766 
of 
Employees GREECE 210 230 216 

  ITALY 1472 588 1005 
  PORTUGAL 736 431 474 
  SPAIN 744 480 524 

Profit 
(losses)  FRANCE 2103 2237 2210 
before 
taxes  GREECE -576 -96 -409 

  ITALY 895 569 712 
  PORTUGAL 1506 50 282 
  SPAIN 2385 2071 2126 

Long  FRANCE 3897 2813 3029 
Term Debt GREECE 10321 15885 12256 

  ITALY 9902 26619 19287 
  PORTUGAL 9948 17418 16532 
  SPAIN 30664 25601 26493 

Source: AMADEUS and Euromonitor International 
 

CONCLUSIONS 
 

This study is a first attempt to investigate corporate performance, 
internationalisation and a location’s competitiveness.  The key contribution of this 
study is dual.  On the one hand to provide a thorough literature review on the current 
global picture of the tourism industry and the role of multinational enterprises and on 
the other to offer a first reading of the situation in an important, in terms of the tourism 
sector, geographic region that of the South Mediterranean countries, i.e. France, 
Greece, Italy, Portugal and Spain.  The study identifies the key challenges that 
multinationals active in the industry face and then provides a descriptive discussion of 
the situation in the above mentioned countries.  It goes beyond the scope of this paper 
to offer substantial econometric evidence on the interrelationship between a location’s 
competitiveness and multinationals’ performance.  We suggest that as a key stream for 



future research though.  The key scope of this study is to re-establish the agenda of 
tourism industry within the context of international business. 
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   EMU and FDI Flows Among selected EU countries 
 
 
Abstract 
 
This paper investigates whether the big economic and institutional change in Europe, 
European Monetary Union (EMU), has caused significant impacts and changed the behavior 
of Foreign Direct Investment (FDI) flows within selected countries in European Union. The 
empirical methodology employs the Lee and Strazicich (1999b, 2004) approach, panel LM 
unit-root test, for the detection of one structural break. The results provide evidence that FDI 
flows are stationary series with one structural break mainly the period before EMU 
inauguration dates. 
 
 Keywords: Stationarity, FDI flows, structural change, European Union, panel data 
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Introduction 

In 1992 “The Treaty of European Union (TEU)” was signed in Maastricht aiming at 
the creation of the European Monetary Union (EMU). The Internal Market 
Programme had already stimulated the mobility of capital within EU. From 1994 until 
1999, intra- EU FDI flows were equivalent to 4½ % of gross domestic fixed capital 
formation in the EU on average, as compared to 2% in the previous 5 years (Barrell 
and Pain 1997). 

EMU was expected to minimize destabilizing speculation, increase transparency and 
reliability of rules and policies. The removal of the exchange-rate uncertainty would 
encourage cross-border investment in the EU economies (Commission, 1990, ch. 1). 
This is considered important since uncertainty about future returns may discourage 
investment (Dixit A. and Pyndick R., 1994).  
 
So far studies have been limited in the examination of specific countries and focus 
mainly on the determinants of FDI inflows towards EU countries and the effects of 
exchanfe rate on FDI. (Clegg (1992), Lunn (1980). This paper investigates the 
integration properties of time series of FDI flows in order to test for the impact of the 
institutional changes that caused EMU, on FDI flows among selected EU members. 
The integration properties are important characteristics for the use of FDI variables in 
other researches, as well as, for policy evaluation. We apply the Lee and Strazicich 
(1999b, 2004) methodology to detect possible structural break, identify the break date 
and evaluate the importance and the impacts of this economic and institutional event 
on capital flows. We employ an LM-type test that allows for testing the unit root 
hypothesis in the presence of one endogenously determined structural break in the 
level. The empirical analysis uses annual panel data for FDI flows within EU and 
covers the period from 1991 to 2005. The results provide evidence that FDI flows are 
stationary series with one structural break prior the establishment of EMU. 
 
The paper is organized as follows: The second section introduces the theoretical 
framework. The third section presents the methodology. The fourth section reports the 
data and the empirical results. Finally, the fifth section discusses and offers some 
concluding remarks. 

 

Theoretical framework 

European Monetary Union constitutes a major institutional change in the world 
economy. It affects FDI decisions through different channels. The removal of the 
exchange-rate uncertainty would encourage cross-border investment in the EU 
economies because it was expected to minimize destabilizing speculation, increase 
transparency and reliability of rules and policies. Therefore, the single currency would 
be a powerful incentive for cross- border investments (Commission of the EC, 1990).  

 The main advantage of economic integration is the transition from floating to fixed 
exchange rates, which eliminates the risk.  
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According to OECD (1992), the prospect of a large unified market attracts investors 
due to stable exchange rate, monetary discipline and lower costs. Molle and Morsink 
(1991b) examined the effect of Monetary Union on FDI and concluded that exchange 
rate risk may discourage FDI. Aizenman J. (1992) reached similar conclusion that 
fixed exchange rates regime is more conductive to FDI than the flexible exchange 
rate, regardless of the type of the shock taking place in an economy. In case of 
monetary shocks, the production function implies that shocks will reduce expected 
profits under a flexible exchange rate regime, while fixed exchange rates are able to 
isolate the level of employment and production from monetary shocks and are related 
to higher expected profits. This, consequently, encourages domestic investment and 
FDI. However, for the case of horizontal FDIs, the removal of exchange rate volatility 
may decrease FDI and increase trade flows as a substitute. Broll and Zilcha (1992) set 
two models, of vertical and of horizontal product differentiation. In the first one, the 
effects of volatility depend on the uncertain exchange rate, while in the second one is 
a function of the shape of the profit function.  
 
Dixit A. and Pyndick R.(1994) claimed that uncertainty about future returns may 
discourage investment. This holds for risk-averse firms, since monetary integration 
increases the certainty value of their expected profits, reduces the trade costs and 
favours vertical FDI. An implication of this is that companies can expand their 
production output by placing their activities in countries- members of EU according to 
differences in factor prices or other locational advantages.  Darby et al. (1999) 
claimed that there is a negative impact of exchange rate uncertainty on investments. 
The model is an extended version of Dixit - Pindyck (1994) and suggests that 
exchange rate volatility affects FDI in two reverse ways. On the one hand, it 
discourages investment because the firm will only invest if the present value of the 
expected revenues is higher, by an amount equal to the value of waiting, than the 
entry sunk cost. On the other hand, the opportunity cost of waiting raises with 
exchange rate volatility and hence boosts investment.  
Some studies agree with the above authors under conditions. More specifically, 
Tamim Bayoumi and Gabrielle Lipworth (1997) claimed that only the case of a 
depreciation of the host country's currency has a positive effect on FDI inflows, since 
depreciation lowers the costs of production in host countries relative to the cost in 
source countries and thus, making foreign investment more profitable and attractive. 
Later, Sung and Lapan (2000), who were also influenced by Dixit-Pindyck (1994) 
model, argued that, under exchange rate uncertainty, investments abroad may be 
useful in forwarding the production abroad in case the foreign currency depreciates. 
Kozo Kiyota and Shujiro Urata (2004) examined Japan's FDI by industries and agreed 
that the depreciation of the currency of a host country attracted FDI, while the high 
variability of the exchange rate discouraged FDI.  
 
Bénassy-Quéré et al. (2001), agreeing with the above authors, argues that an increase 
in the volatility of nominal exchange rate leads to a reduction in FDI. This is due to 
the fact that a risk averse firm locates in two different foreign positions in order to 
export from one to another. These transportation costs influence the elasticity of FDI 
to exchange rate uncertainty, since regardless of the sign of correlation between the 
two exchange rates, an increase in the variability of exchange rate leads to a reduction 
in FDI. Furthermore, lower volatility of exchange rate in a country increases the 
sensitivity of output in that country to local costs.  
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Cushman (1985) analyzed the effects of real exchange rate risk and expectations on 
FDI and concluded that an increase in exchange rate volatility reduces the real 
exchange rate risk and therefore, lowers the expenditure of domestic financing of 
foreign capital which implies an increase in FDI. He observed positive effects of 
exchange rate volatility on annual, bilateral FDI flows from the United States to the 
United Kingdom, France, Germany, Canada and Japan. In line with Cushman (1985), 
Goldberg and Kolstad (1995), studying bilateral investment flows between the U.S. 
and the U.K., Canada and Japan, claimed that floating exchange rates stimulate the 
activity of foreign investments. The financial markets’ development and the 
exchange- rate liberalization increase predictability for the decision process and 
enhance investor confidence (Culem C., 1988). In line with them, Roy and Viaene, 
(1998) argued that an increase in foreign exchange variability has a positive impact on 
vertical FDI. 
 
Another important advantage, as an implication of the creation of a monetary union, is 
the reduction of transaction costs when it is necessary to change currency in order to 
curry out a transaction. Transaction costs from currency exchange are financial costs 
and in-house costs. Emerson (1992) estimated that for the members of the European 
Monetary Union, total savings from abolishing conversion within Europe, including 
savings from “reductions in inefficiencies inside firms,” were at 0.4 percent of GDP1.  
 
On the other hand, according to Richard Ware (1998), the constitutional dimension of 
the currency unification implies that sovereignty over monetary policy has been 
limited. The limitation of the national independence means the loss of the possibility 
of absorbing big shocks via devaluation or revaluation or an adjustment in domestic 
monetary policy. Governments are not able to decide their domestic policy that allows 
for adjustment if disequilibrium in balance of payment arises from the implementation 
of domestic policy. However, there is another opinion that claims, that if countries are 
facing shocks, the loss of monetary policies as means for adjustment could be 
compensated by other mechanisms under the condition that these countries are highly 
integrated. These mechanisms include flexibility in prices and wages, mobility of 
labour and other factors of production, or fiscal transfers2.  
 
Another opinion which explains the reduction of FDI flows among members of EMU 
is that when the members of a union are dissimilar, a common monetary policy is 
unlikely to be optimal for all members, due to differences among them, which is one 
of the main determinants of FDI. Also, a shift in the political culture of the Member 
States may occur and not find all members ready to accept. In this regard, Boone and 
Maurel (1999) showed that the members of EMU whose economic cycle is similar to 
that of Germany (the largest European economy) would be favoured by the adoption 
of the euro.  
 
Concluding, EMU created a new regulatory framework which reduces 
macroeconomic instability, eliminates risk and encourages investments, since it 

                                                 
1
. For small open and less developed European economies, they estimated such savings at 1 percent of GDP. 

2 Some economists argue that redistribution of income through the federal government is one of the key reasons why the currency 

union in the United States, which originally did not represent an optimal currency area, has survived without major problems 

(Sala-i-Martin and Sachs, 1991). Other reasons include labor and capital mobility 
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makes cost and pricing decision more predictable, even with the cost of the loss of a 
policy instrument (Lane P., 2006). Therefore, we posit the following hypothesis: 
 
H2: “The implementation of EMU caused structural change on the Foreign Direct 
Investment flows within selected EU countries”. 
 
 
Methodological Issues 
 
The presence of structural breaks in time series data can imply a behavior similar to that of a 
non- stationary process which makes difficult to distinguish between a unit root and a 
stationary process with shift. The existing panel unit root tests, such as the IPS (Im, Pesaran 
and Shin, 2003), the MW (Maddala and Wu, 1999) and the modified Augmented Dickey 
Fuller (ADF) type tests, test the assumption of no break under the null hypothesis and cause 
the test statistic to diverge from its asymptotic properties, leading to size distortions (Nunes, 
Newbold and Kuan (1997), Lee & Strazicich (2001)). Im, Lee and Tieslau (2002), proposed 
an LM panel unit root test whose most important feature is that its asymptotic distribution 
does not depend on parameters that indicate the existence, the number and the date of the 
structural breaks in each cross section unit. In line with them, Lee and Strazicich (1999b, 
2004) proposed an LM unit root test with endogenous break selection process, which provides 
greater flexibility and accuracy in the determination of the break dates. The break dates are 
selected where the statistic for the unit root null hypothesis is minimized. It has to be 
underlined that the invariance property of the LM unit root test does not hold in the presence 
of changes in trend slope, when it is applied on panel data, even though it does under the 
presence of level shifts. 
More specifically, in the LM unit roots test statistic of Lee and Strazicich (1999, 2004) for 
panel data, the LM- statistic follows the asymptotic distribution, which also holds if dummies 
are included to test possible structural breaks, as long as N/T→k, for each finite intercept k, as 
long as Ν,Τ → ∞. As Amsler and Lee (1995) showed, the LM statistic for the i th time series 
can arise as a t-statistic when testing for φi=0 in the regression.  
 
∆yi,t = γ2i + δi ∆Dit + φi Ŝi,t-1 +      ρij ∆Ŝi,t-j + ε2t  (1) 
 
Where S�i,t-1=yi,t-1-γ�2i(t-1)-δ�iDi,t-1 and γ�2i and δ�i are the ordinary least square estimators of γ2i and 
δi from the restricted regression ∆yi,t = γ2i + δi ∆Dit + εi,t. 

Letting Ŝi,-1 =(Ŝi0, Ŝi1, …, Ŝi,T-1 )` and  ∆Di = (∆Di1, ∆Di2,…,∆DiT )΄, the LM t-statistic for the 
i th series that tests the null hypothesis φ=0 in regression (4) series can be expressed as:  
 

 
 
 
Data 
 
The data employed in the empirical analysis are annual FDI flows among selected EU 
countries-members that join EMU. The countries were selected taking into consideration the 
fact that there are bilateral FDI flows among them, as well as the availability regarding a 
sufficient time span which in our analysis covers a fifteen year horizon, from 1992- 2005. 
More specifically, among the first twelve countries that have adopted the common currency 
euro, five have established bilateral FDI flows among them and these are: France, Germany, 
Netherlands, Portugal and Spain.  

 
pi 

Σ      
j=1 
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Regarding the rest of the countries, we should mention that FDI outflows from Belgium and 
Luxemburg are presented summed and cover only a 4 year time horizon (2001-2003). 
Concerning FDI outflows from Austria, Italy, Ireland, Finland and Greece it was not possible 
to acquire complete data set for the examined flows among them. Besides, in the cases of 
Ireland and Greece, the available data do not cover a period longer than 10 years. Finally, 
since UK and Denmark have not entered EMU, they are excluded from the sample of 
countries. The data come from UNCTAD.  
 
 
Empirical Results and Discussion 
 
This paper uses the panel LM unit root test of Lee and Strazicich (1999, 2004) to determine 
endogenously the location of a structural break in FDI flows within EU.   
More particularly, we test the integration properties of the FDI outflows from France towards 
Germany, Netherlands, Portugal and Spain, accounting for the existence of one possible 
structural break. Τhe results provide evidence that when the one break minimum LM unit root 
test is applied regarding the FDI outflows series from France, the results suggest that the FDI 
series are stationary with one structural break. The detected break dates for the four countries 
are as follows: for Germany (1996), for Netherlands (2001), for Portugal (1997) and for Spain 
(1994).  
Also, the FDI outflows series from Germany are stationary with a structural break, which is 
detected in the following dates: for France (1996), for Netherlands (1995), for Portugal (2002) 
and for Spain (1998). 
Concerning the FDI outflows from Netherlands, the findings suggest that the FDI series are 
stationary with a structural break. The detected break dates for the four countries are 
identified as follows: France (1998), Germany (1998), Portugal (1998) and Spain (2000). 
Regarding the FDI outflows from Portugal, the test suggests that the FDI series are stationary 
with a structural break. The detected break dates are as follows: for France (2003), for 
Germany (2001), for Netherlands (2001), and for Spain (1998). 
Finally, with reference to the FDI outflows from Spain, there is also evidence in favour of 
stationarity with breaks. The detected break dates are as follows: for France (1998), for 
Germany (2002), for Netherlands (1998) and for Portugal (1998). 
 
Through this investigation, we can imply that a change in the intercept of the testing model in 
the flows could indicate a jump in the level of the FDI flows possibly due to the changes in 
the regulatory framework. This refers to microeconomic regulations implemented in product, 
labour and financial markets. Such shifts include competition policies, entry barriers, tax and 
benefit systems, rules to protect employment, education and motives given to research and 
development. They are considered important and influential for FDI because they enhance the 
possibility of economic growth and assists in adaptation of the economic changes. Therefore, 
the oncoming consequences of EMU, like exchange rate stability, greater transparency, 
monetary discipline and reduction of the transaction costs could explain the motivation of 
firms from European countries to enforce investment in other countries- members of EU.   

 
Moreover, the negotiations among governments on investments are carried out at a bilateral 
level within EU and a considerable increase of cross-border investment flows and investment-
related agreements3 (IIAs) have been observed in the past decade (Radu A., 2008). More 
specifically, the Netherlands, Finland, Germany and Spain accounted for the majority of the 
new bilateral investment agreements, which where contracted after 1993 (UNCTAD, 2008). 
According to A. Mestral (2008), the EU member states have been some of the most prolific 

                                                 
3 There are more than 150 intra-EU BITs, most of them concluded between the 12 new members and EU-15.  
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bilateral investment treaty makers with Germany and France as two of the leaders.  
 
 
Conclusion 
 
Since it is clear from the literature that the monetary integration tends to increase FDI within 
and towards the European region (Dixit and Pindyck (1994), Darby et al (1999), Commission 
(1990) etc.), the examination of possible structural changes in the behavior FDI inflows that 
has been caused is a matter of great importance. Thus, we attempted to investigate the 
integration properties of FDI flows within selected EU countries accounting for the presence 
of the potential existence of one endogenously determined structural break in the levels. 
Actually, we tested whether Foreign Direct Investment flows could be characterized as a unit 
root (non- stationary) process with a shift in the levels. The results revealed stationary FDI 
flows that following a shock, they revert to their trends implying that shocks have transitory 
effects. It is essential to note that such shocks were mostly observed in the period 1995-1999. 
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Panel Lm unit root test with one structural break 
 

Home 
country Host Country 

Univariate 
LM unit 
root test 
statistic 

Optimal lag 
length (k) 

Break 
Location 

France     
 Germany -1.221 2 1996 
 Netherlands -2.407*** 0 2001 
 Portugal -1.608* 0 1997 
 Spain -2.660*** 0 1994 

Germany     
 France -4.426*** 2 1996 
 Netherlands       -6.371*** 2 1995 
 Portugal -3.139*** 2 2002 
 Spain -0.288 2 1998 

Netherlands     
 France -4.958*** 0 1998 
 Netherlands -4.561*** 0 1998 
 Portugal -4.982*** 0 1998 
 Spain -2.311** 1 2000 

Portugal     
 France -5.717*** 2 2003 
 Germany -1.963** 0 2001 
 Netherlands -2.756*** 2 2001 
 Spain -3.220*** 0 1998 

Spain     
 France -4.853*** 1 1998 
 Germany -4.440*** 1 2002 
 Netherlands -4.372*** 1 1998 
 Portugal -4.349*** 1 1998 

 
The 1, 5 and 10% critical values for the panel LM unit root test with one break are : -2.326, -
1.645 and -1.282  
*significant at the 10% level 
** significant at the 5% level 
*** significant at the 1% level 
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